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is dangerous.” I pulled him around by his shoulders and 
looked in his face. “Okay, we can run in for a second and 
look around, but hold your breath. Don’t breathe at all. 
Whatever’s in there, we’ll come right back out.”

He nodded and ran into the living room, me behind. 
Nothing in the big living room. Down the hall to the 
kitchen. Even though I was holding my breath, I gulped a 
little and smelled the gas. Heavy. 

Cal pointed at the hose, which led from the back of 
the giant stove down into the basement. The basement 
door was wedged over the bent hose, so that it was open a 
couple of inches. He threw open the door and we almost 
ran down the narrow stairs.

We might have been in the room for fifteen seconds, 
maybe less, but what I saw will be with me forever. Mr. 
and Mrs. Pokorny were on the giant bed, lying against the 
pillows. Between them were the big boy and girl dolls. The 
boy doll was wearing an old gray suit and black tie. The 
girl doll had her hair up in a bun, and she was wearing a 
faded-print housedress. Everyone’s eyes on the bed were 
wide open, staring.

There was tea in all the cups on the little tables. On 
the bed, on the old salver, there were four cups. Mrs. Po-
korny must have poured the tea right before she assumed 
her position next to the girl doll. Their cups were two-
thirds full, undisturbed and waiting. 

Before running back upstairs, I looked closely at Mrs. 
Pokorny. It was the first time I’d seen her smile.
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